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Hunt Military Communities Takes Home Numerous Customer Satisfaction Awards 

El Paso, TX, January 23, 2017 – Hunt Military Communities, the nation’s largest privatized 
military housing developer, is pleased to announce that it received both the Platinum A List and 
A list awards for customer service excellence.  The nationally recognized awards are based on 
the results of a comprehensive resident satisfaction survey managed by nationally recognized 
benchmarking firm CEL & Associates, Inc. 

“Hunt Military Communities is honored to have received these prestigious awards for more than 
35 neighborhoods throughout our military communities,” stated John Ehle, Hunt Military 
Communities’ President.  “These awards demonstrate that we are listening to our residents and 
making the changes they’ve asked for to continue offering them the best living experience 
possible.” 

The annual survey allows residents to score their neighborhood on factors such as 
maintenance, communication, leasing procedures and many additional items.  It also allows 
residents the opportunity to suggest improvements, where needed.   

The survey is conducted at all privatized military housing developments throughout the country.  
Hunt received CEL A-list awards at the following properties: 

• USAF Academy  
• Arnold AFB 
• Bolling AFB 
• Charleston AFB 
• Crane Naval Base 
• Dover  AFB 
• Dyess AFB 
• Little Rock AFB 
• Fort Lee  
• Goodfellow AFB 

• Hanscom AFB 
• Kirtland AFB 
• Laughlin AFB 
• Millington Naval Base 
• Navy Northwest  
• Nellis AFB 
• Patrick AFB 
• Redstone  
• Shaw AFB 

 
Each year CEL & Associates, Inc. compiles customer satisfaction survey data from thousands 
of properties. CEL & Associates, Inc.’s A List and A List Platinum Awards for Customer Service 
Excellence are awarded to those companies/properties that truly provide a superior level of 
service. Since 1998, this award has become the National Standard for Service. 

 



About Hunt Military Communities 

Hunt’s Military Communities division is a 50-year partnership created between the Department 
of Defense and Hunt through the Military Housing Privatization Act.  As part of the partnership, 
Hunt owns approximately 52,000 units spread across more than 40 military installations on 
Navy, Air Force, Marine Corps, and Army installations and is the largest privatized military 
housing developer in the nation. 

About Hunt 

Founded in 1947, Hunt Companies, Inc. (Hunt) is today a holding company that invests in 
business focused in the real estate and infrastructure markets.  The activities of Hunt’s affiliates 
and investees include investment management, mortgage banking, direct lending, loan 
servicing, asset management, property management, development, construction, consulting 
and advisory.  

For more information on Hunt, visit www.huntcompanies.com. 
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